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[February 21, 2020] 

 The Senate met pursuant to the directive of the President. 

 Pursuant to Senate Rule 2-5(c)2, the Secretary of the Senate conducted the perfunctory session. 

 Silent prayer was observed. 

 
 

MESSAGE FROM THE PRESIDENT 

 

OFFICE OF THE SENATE PRESIDENT 

DON HARMON 

STATE OF ILLINOIS 

 

327 STATE CAPITOL  160 N. LASALLE ST., STE. 720 
SPRINGFIELD, ILLINOIS 62706  CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60601 

217-782-2728  312-814-2075 

 
February 21, 2020 

 

Mr. Tim Anderson 
Secretary of the Senate 

Room 401 State House 

Springfield, IL 62706 
 

Dear Mr. Secretary: 

 
Pursuant to Rule 2-10, I am scheduling a Perfunctory Session to convene on February 21, 2020. 

 

Sincerely, 
s/Don Harmon 

Don Harmon 

Senate President 
 

cc: Senate Republican Leader Bill Brady 

 

 

LEGISLATIVE MEASURES FILED 

 

The following Committee amendments to the Senate Bills listed below have been filed with the Secretary 

and referred to the Committee on Assignments: 

 

 Amendment No. 1 to Senate Bill 2310 

 Amendment No. 1 to Senate Bill 3060 

 
 

PRESENTATION OF RESOLUTION 

 

SENATE RESOLUTION NO. 1045 

 Offered by Senator Barickman and all Senators:  

 Mourns the death of Marvin Gerstein of Urbana. 
 

 By direction of the Secretary, the foregoing resolution was referred to the Resolutions Consent 

Calendar.  
 

  

INTRODUCTION OF BILLS 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3899.  Introduced by Senator Rezin, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

government. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
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[February 21, 2020] 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3900.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 
Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3901.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 
appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3902.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 
appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3903.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 
 SENATE BILL NO. 3904.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 
Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3905.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 
appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3906.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 
 SENATE BILL NO. 3907.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3908.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 
appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3909.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 
 SENATE BILL NO. 3910.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 
Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3911.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 
appropriations. 
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 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3912.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 
appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3913.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3914.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 
 SENATE BILL NO. 3915.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 
Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3916.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT making 
appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3917.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 
 SENATE BILL NO. 3918.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 
Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3919.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3920.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 
 SENATE BILL NO. 3921.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 
Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3922.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 
appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
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 SENATE BILL NO. 3923.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3924.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 
 SENATE BILL NO. 3925.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 
 SENATE BILL NO. 3926.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 
Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3927.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 
appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3928.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 
 SENATE BILL NO. 3929.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 
Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3930.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 
appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3931.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 
 SENATE BILL NO. 3932.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 
Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3933.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 
appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3934.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
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[February 21, 2020] 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3935.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 
Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3936.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 
appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3937.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 
appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3938.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 
 SENATE BILL NO. 3939.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT making 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 
Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3940.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 
appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3941.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 
 SENATE BILL NO. 3942.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3943.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 
appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3944.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 
 SENATE BILL NO. 3945.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 
Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3946.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 
appropriations. 
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 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3947.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 
appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3948.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3949.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 
 SENATE BILL NO. 3950.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 
Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3951.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 
appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3952.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 
 SENATE BILL NO. 3953.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 
Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3954.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3955.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 
 SENATE BILL NO. 3956.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 
Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3957.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 
appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
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 SENATE BILL NO. 3958.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3959.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 
 SENATE BILL NO. 3960.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 
 SENATE BILL NO. 3961.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 
Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3962.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT making 
appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3963.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 
 SENATE BILL NO. 3964.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 
Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3965.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 
appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3966.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 
 SENATE BILL NO. 3967.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 
Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3968.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 
appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3969.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
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 SENATE BILL NO. 3970.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 
Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3971.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 
appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3972.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 
appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3973.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 
 SENATE BILL NO. 3974.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 
Assignments. 

 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3975.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 
appropriations. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 
 

 SENATE BILL NO. 3976.  Introduced by Senator Harmon, a bill for AN ACT concerning 

appropriations. 
 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 
 SENATE BILL NO. 3977.  Introduced by Senator Belt, a bill for AN ACT concerning regulation. 

 The bill was taken up, read by title a first time, ordered printed and referred to the Committee on 

Assignments. 

 

 

 At the hour of 2:42 o'clock p.m., pursuant to House Joint Resolution No. 111, the Chair announced 
that the Senate stands adjourned until Tuesday, February 25, 2020, at 12:00 o'clock noon, or until the call 

of the President.  


