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 The House met pursuant to adjournment. 
 Representative Poe in the chair. 
 Prayer by Anthony D. Rossi, Clerk of the House  
 Amber L. Evans, Minutes Clerk led the House in the Pledge of Allegiance. 
 

 
FISCAL NOTE SUPPLIED 

 
 A Fiscal Note has been supplied for HOUSE BILL 6. 
 
 

INTRODUCTION AND FIRST READING OF BILLS 
 

 The following bills were introduced, read by title a first time, ordered printed and placed in the 
Committee on Rules: 
 HOUSE BILL 0540.  Introduced by Representative Mitchell, Bill, AN ACT concerning higher 
education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0541.  Introduced by Representative Soto, AN ACT in relation to criminal law. 
 HOUSE BILL 0542.  Introduced by Representative Flowers, AN ACT concerning professional 
regulation. 
 HOUSE BILL 0543.  Introduced by Representative Turner, AN ACT in relation to gambling. 
 HOUSE BILL 0544.  Introduced by Representative Hannig, AN ACT concerning Fire Protection 
Districts. 
 HOUSE BILL 0545.  Introduced by Representative Moffitt, AN ACT in relation to gambling. 
 HOUSE BILL 0546.  Introduced by Representatives Kelly - Feigenholtz, AN ACT concerning 
education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0547.  Introduced by Representative Feigenholtz, AN ACT in relation to criminal law. 
 HOUSE BILL 0548.  Introduced by Representative Feigenholtz, AN ACT concerning pest control. 
 HOUSE BILL 0549.  Introduced by Representative Feigenholtz, AN ACT concerning adoption. 
 HOUSE BILL 0550.  Introduced by Representative Feigenholtz, AN ACT concerning adoption. 
 HOUSE BILL 0551.  Introduced by Representative Saviano, AN ACT in relation to criminal law. 
 HOUSE BILL 0552.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Collins, AN ACT in relation 
to minors. 
 HOUSE BILL 0553.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Collins, AN ACT concerning 
juveniles. 
 HOUSE BILL 0554.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Collins, AN ACT in relation 
to minors. 
 HOUSE BILL 0555.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Collins, AN ACT in relation 
to minors. 
 HOUSE BILL 0556.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Collins, AN ACT in relation 
to children and families. 
 HOUSE BILL 0557.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - O'Brien, AN ACT in relation 
to freedom of information. 
 HOUSE BILL 0558.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - O'Brien, AN ACT in relation 
to videotaped confessions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0559.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - O'Brien, AN ACT concerning 
racial profiling. 
 HOUSE BILL 0560.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - O'Brien, AN ACT in relation 
to criminal law. 
 HOUSE BILL 0561.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - O'Brien, AN ACT in relation 
to criminal law. 
 HOUSE BILL 0562.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - O'Brien, AN ACT in relation 
to criminal law. 
 HOUSE BILL 0563.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - O'Brien, AN ACT in relation 
to criminal law. 
 HOUSE BILL 0564.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - O'Brien, AN ACT in relation 
to criminal law. 
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 HOUSE BILL 0565.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - O'Brien, AN ACT in relation 
to criminal law. 
 HOUSE BILL 0566.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - O'Brien, AN ACT in relation 
to criminal law. 
 HOUSE BILL 0567.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - O'Brien, AN ACT concerning 
criminal law. 
 HOUSE BILL 0568.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - O'Brien, AN ACT concerning 
criminal law. 
 HOUSE BILL 0569.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - O'Brien, AN ACT in relation 
to criminal law. 
 HOUSE BILL 0570.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - O'Brien, AN ACT in relation 
to criminal law. 
 HOUSE BILL 0571.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - O'Brien, AN ACT in relation 
to criminal law. 
 HOUSE BILL 0572.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - O'Brien, AN ACT in relation 
to criminal law. 
 HOUSE BILL 0573.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - O'Brien, AN ACT concerning 
corrections. 
 HOUSE BILL 0574.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - O'Brien, AN ACT in relation 
to imprisonment. 
 HOUSE BILL 0575.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - O'Brien, AN ACT concerning 
juvenile offenders. 
 HOUSE BILL 0576.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - O'Brien, AN ACT concerning 
the death penalty. 
 HOUSE BILL 0577.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - O'Brien, AN ACT concerning 
the death penalty. 
 HOUSE BILL 0578.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - O'Brien, AN ACT concerning 
the death penalty. 
 HOUSE BILL 0579.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - O'Brien, AN ACT concerning 
the death penalty. 
 HOUSE BILL 0580.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0581.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0582.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0583.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0584.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0585.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0586.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0587.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0588.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0589.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0590.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0591.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0592.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 



 5 [January 31, 2003] 
 
 HOUSE BILL 0593.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0594.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0595.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0596.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0597.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0598.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0599.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0600.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0601.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0602.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0603.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0604.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0605.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0606.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0607.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0608.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0609.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0610.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0611.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0612.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0613.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0614.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0615.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to pensions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0616.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Bradley, AN ACT in relation 
to public employee benefits. 
 HOUSE BILL 0617.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hamos, AN ACT concerning 
land development. 
 HOUSE BILL 0618.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hamos, AN ACT concerning 
land development. 
 HOUSE BILL 0619.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hamos, AN ACT concerning 
land development. 
 HOUSE BILL 0620.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hamos, AN ACT in relation to 
economic development. 
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 HOUSE BILL 0621.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hamos, AN ACT in relation to 
economic development. 
 HOUSE BILL 0622.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hamos, AN ACT in relation to 
economic development. 
 HOUSE BILL 0623.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hamos, AN ACT in relation to 
economic development. 
 HOUSE BILL 0624.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hamos, AN ACT in relation to 
housing. 
 HOUSE BILL 0625.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hamos, AN ACT in relation to 
housing. 
 HOUSE BILL 0626.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hamos, AN ACT in relation to 
housing. 
 HOUSE BILL 0627.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hamos, AN ACT in relation to 
urban problems. 
 HOUSE BILL 0628.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hamos, AN ACT in relation to 
urban renewal. 
 HOUSE BILL 0629.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Boland, AN ACT in relation 
to elections. 
 HOUSE BILL 0630.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Boland, AN ACT in relation 
to elections. 
 HOUSE BILL 0631.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Boland, AN ACT in relation 
to elections. 
 HOUSE BILL 0632.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Boland, AN ACT in relation 
to elections. 
 HOUSE BILL 0633.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Boland, AN ACT in relation 
to governmental ethics. 
 HOUSE BILL 0634.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Boland, AN ACT in relation 
to elections. 
 HOUSE BILL 0635.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Boland, AN ACT in relation 
to governmental ethics. 
 HOUSE BILL 0636.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Boland, AN ACT in relation 
to governmental ethics. 
 HOUSE BILL 0637.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Boland, AN ACT in relation 
to governmental ethics. 
 HOUSE BILL 0638.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Boland, AN ACT to amend 
the State Gift Ban Act. 
 HOUSE BILL 0639.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Boland, AN ACT in relation 
to governmental ethics. 
 HOUSE BILL 0640.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Boland, AN ACT in relation 
to elections. 
 HOUSE BILL 0641.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Boland, AN ACT in relation 
to elections. 
 HOUSE BILL 0642.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Boland, AN ACT in relation 
to elections. 
 HOUSE BILL 0643.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Boland, AN ACT in relation 
to elections. 
 HOUSE BILL 0644.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Boland, AN ACT in relation 
to elections. 
 HOUSE BILL 0645.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Boland, AN ACT in relation 
to elections. 
 HOUSE BILL 0646.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Boland, AN ACT in relation 
to elections. 
 HOUSE BILL 0647.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Boland, AN ACT to amend 
the Election Code. 
 HOUSE BILL 0648.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Reitz, AN ACT in relation to 
animals. 
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 HOUSE BILL 0649.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Reitz, AN ACT in relation to 
animals. 
 HOUSE BILL 0650.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Reitz, AN ACT concerning 
agriculture. 
 HOUSE BILL 0651.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Reitz, AN ACT concerning 
agriculture. 
 HOUSE BILL 0652.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Reitz, AN ACT in relation to 
wildlife. 
 HOUSE BILL 0653.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Reitz, AN ACT in relation to 
wildlife. 
 HOUSE BILL 0654.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Reitz, AN ACT in relation to 
bodies of water. 
 HOUSE BILL 0655.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Reitz, AN ACT concerning 
natural resources. 
 HOUSE BILL 0656.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Reitz, AN ACT in relation to 
wildlife. 
 HOUSE BILL 0657.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Reitz, AN ACT in relation to 
wildlife. 
 HOUSE BILL 0658.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Reitz, AN ACT concerning 
conservation. 
 HOUSE BILL 0659.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Reitz, AN ACT concerning 
waterways. 
 HOUSE BILL 0660.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Reitz, AN ACT concerning 
agriculture. 
 HOUSE BILL 0661.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Reitz, AN ACT concerning 
agriculture. 
 HOUSE BILL 0662.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Reitz, AN ACT concerning 
agriculture. 
 HOUSE BILL 0663.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Reitz, AN ACT concerning 
natural resources. 
 HOUSE BILL 0664.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Reitz, AN ACT concerning 
grain. 
 HOUSE BILL 0665.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Reitz, AN ACT concerning 
grain. 
 HOUSE BILL 0666.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Reitz, AN ACT in relation to 
conservation. 
 HOUSE BILL 0667.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Reitz, AN ACT in relation to 
agriculture. 
 HOUSE BILL 0668.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Reitz, AN ACT in relation to 
agriculture. 
 HOUSE BILL 0669.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Holbrook, AN ACT in relation 
to executive agencies. 
 HOUSE BILL 0670.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Holbrook, AN ACT in relation 
to taxes. 
 HOUSE BILL 0671.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Holbrook, AN ACT in relation 
to tourism development. 
 HOUSE BILL 0672.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Holbrook, AN ACT 
concerning promotion. 
 HOUSE BILL 0673.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Holbrook, AN ACT in relation 
to taxes. 
 HOUSE BILL 0674.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT in relation to senior 
citizens. 
 HOUSE BILL 0675.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT in relation to senior 
citizens. 
 HOUSE BILL 0676.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT in relation to senior 
citizens. 
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 HOUSE BILL 0677.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT relating to 
insurance. 
 HOUSE BILL 0678.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT in relation 
to insurance. 
 HOUSE BILL 0679.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT relating to 
children's health insurance. 
 HOUSE BILL 0680.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT concerning 
children's health. 
 HOUSE BILL 0681.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT concerning 
the Comprehensive Health Insurance Plan. 
 HOUSE BILL 0682.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT concerning 
the Comprehensive Health Insurance Plan. 
 HOUSE BILL 0683.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT concerning 
the regulation of professions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0684.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT concerning 
disabled persons. 
 HOUSE BILL 0685.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT concerning 
disabled persons. 
 HOUSE BILL 0686.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT in relation 
to health. 
 HOUSE BILL 0687.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT in relation 
to health. 
 HOUSE BILL 0688.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT in relation 
to children. 
 HOUSE BILL 0689.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT in relation 
to children. 
 HOUSE BILL 0690.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT concerning 
public health. 
 HOUSE BILL 0691.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT in relation 
to public health. 
 HOUSE BILL 0692.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT in relation 
to children and families. 
 HOUSE BILL 0693.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT in relation 
to children and families. 
 HOUSE BILL 0694.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT in relation 
to child care. 
 HOUSE BILL 0695.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT concerning 
child care. 
 HOUSE BILL 0696.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT concerning 
human services. 
 HOUSE BILL 0697.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT in relation 
to human services. 
 HOUSE BILL 0698.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT in relation 
to public aid. 
 HOUSE BILL 0699.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT in relation 
to public aid. 
 HOUSE BILL 0700.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT in relation 
to public aid. 
 HOUSE BILL 0701.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT in relation 
to public aid. 
 HOUSE BILL 0702.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT in relation 
to public aid. 
 HOUSE BILL 0703.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT in relation 
to public aid. 
 HOUSE BILL 0704.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT concerning 
the Comprehensive Health Insurance Plan. 
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 HOUSE BILL 0705.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT concerning 
children's health programs. 
 HOUSE BILL 0706.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT in relation 
to insurance. 
 HOUSE BILL 0707.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Delgado, AN ACT concerning 
the Comprehensive Health Insurance Plan. 
 HOUSE BILL 0708.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in relation 
to waterways. 
 HOUSE BILL 0709.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in relation 
to highways. 
 HOUSE BILL 0710.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in relation 
to railroads. 
 HOUSE BILL 0711.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in relation 
to railroads. 
 HOUSE BILL 0712.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in relation 
to transportation. 
 HOUSE BILL 0713.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in relation 
to transportation. 
 HOUSE BILL 0714.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in relation 
to vehicles. 
 HOUSE BILL 0715.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT 
concerning vehicles. 
 HOUSE BILL 0716.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in relation 
to vehicles. 
 HOUSE BILL 0717.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in relation 
to transportation. 
 HOUSE BILL 0718.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT 
concerning vehicles. 
 HOUSE BILL 0719.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in relation 
to vehicles. 
 HOUSE BILL 0720.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT 
concerning vehicles. 
 HOUSE BILL 0721.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in relation 
to airports. 
 HOUSE BILL 0722.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in relation 
to transportation. 
 HOUSE BILL 0723.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in relation 
to aircraft. 
 HOUSE BILL 0724.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in regard 
to highways. 
 HOUSE BILL 0725.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in relation 
to highways. 
 HOUSE BILL 0726.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in relation 
to highways. 
 HOUSE BILL 0727.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT regarding 
highways. 
 HOUSE BILL 0728.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in relation 
to transportation. 
 HOUSE BILL 0729.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT 
concerning special districts. 
 HOUSE BILL 0730.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT 
concerning mass transit. 
 HOUSE BILL 0731.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in relation 
to transportation. 
 HOUSE BILL 0732.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in regard 
to highways. 
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 HOUSE BILL 0733.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in regard 
to highways. 
 HOUSE BILL 0734.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in relation 
to transportation. 
 HOUSE BILL 0735.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT with 
regard to highways. 
 HOUSE BILL 0736.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT 
concerning highways. 
 HOUSE BILL 0737.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in relation 
to highways. 
 HOUSE BILL 0738.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in relation 
to transportation. 
 HOUSE BILL 0739.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in relation 
to highways. 
 HOUSE BILL 0740.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Hoffman, AN ACT in relation 
to waterways. 
 HOUSE BILL 0741.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Burke, AN ACT in relation to 
alcohol. 
 HOUSE BILL 0742.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Burke, AN ACT in relation to 
alcohol. 
 HOUSE BILL 0743.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Burke, AN ACT in relation to 
alcohol. 
 HOUSE BILL 0744.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Burke, AN ACT in relation to 
beverage distribution. 
 HOUSE BILL 0745.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Burke, AN ACT in relation to 
franchises. 
 HOUSE BILL 0746.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Burke, AN ACT in relation to 
franchises. 
 HOUSE BILL 0747.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Burke, AN ACT in relation to 
franchises. 
 HOUSE BILL 0748.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Burke, AN ACT in relation to 
franchises. 
 HOUSE BILL 0749.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Burke, AN ACT in relation to 
alcohol. 
 HOUSE BILL 0750.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Giles, AN ACT concerning 
education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0751.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Giles, AN ACT concerning 
schools. 
 HOUSE BILL 0752.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Giles, AN ACT relating to 
schools. 
 HOUSE BILL 0753.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Giles, AN ACT relating to 
schools. 
 HOUSE BILL 0754.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Giles, AN ACT relating to 
schools. 
 HOUSE BILL 0755.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Giles, AN ACT relating to 
schools. 
 HOUSE BILL 0756.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Giles, AN ACT regarding 
schools. 
 HOUSE BILL 0757.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Giles, AN ACT in relation to 
education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0758.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Giles, AN ACT concerning 
schools. 
 HOUSE BILL 0759.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Giles, AN ACT relating to 
schools. 
 HOUSE BILL 0760.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Giles, AN ACT in relation to 
education. 
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 HOUSE BILL 0761.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Giles, AN ACT in relation to 
education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0762.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Giles, AN ACT concerning 
schools. 
 HOUSE BILL 0763.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Giles, AN ACT relating to 
schools. 
 HOUSE BILL 0764.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Giles, AN ACT relating to 
schools. 
 HOUSE BILL 0765.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Giles, AN ACT in relation to 
education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0766.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Giles, AN ACT relating to 
schools. 
 HOUSE BILL 0767.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Giles, AN ACT concerning 
education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0768.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Giles, AN ACT in relation to 
education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0769.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Giles, AN ACT in relation to 
education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0770.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Giles, AN ACT regarding 
schools. 
 HOUSE BILL 0771.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McGuire, AN ACT in relation 
to aging. 
 HOUSE BILL 0772.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McGuire, AN ACT 
concerning aging. 
 HOUSE BILL 0773.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McGuire, AN ACT in relation 
to aging. 
 HOUSE BILL 0774.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McGuire, AN ACT in relation 
to elderly persons. 
 HOUSE BILL 0775.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McGuire, AN ACT in relation 
to health facilities. 
 HOUSE BILL 0776.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McGuire, AN ACT 
concerning assisted living. 
 HOUSE BILL 0777.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McGuire, AN ACT in relation 
to aging. 
 HOUSE BILL 0778.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McGuire, AN ACT 
concerning elder abuse. 
 HOUSE BILL 0779.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McGuire, AN ACT in relation 
to health facilities. 
 HOUSE BILL 0780.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McGuire, AN ACT in relation 
to health facilities. 
 HOUSE BILL 0781.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McGuire, AN ACT 
concerning nursing home care. 
 HOUSE BILL 0782.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McGuire, AN ACT in relation 
to senior citizens and disabled persons. 
 HOUSE BILL 0783.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McGuire, AN ACT in relation 
to aging. 
 HOUSE BILL 0784.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McGuire, AN ACT 
concerning assistance to citizens. 
 HOUSE BILL 0785.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McGuire, AN ACT in relation 
to aging. 
 HOUSE BILL 0786.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McGuire, AN ACT 
concerning citizen benefits. 
 HOUSE BILL 0787.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McGuire, AN ACT in relation 
to aging. 
 HOUSE BILL 0788.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McGuire, AN ACT 
concerning senior citizens and disabled persons. 
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 HOUSE BILL 0789.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McGuire, AN ACT in relation 
to aging. 
 HOUSE BILL 0790.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Flowers, AN ACT in relation 
to insurance. 
 HOUSE BILL 0791.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to wages. 
 HOUSE BILL 0792.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0793.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT concerning 
labor. 
 HOUSE BILL 0794.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT concerning 
labor. 
 HOUSE BILL 0795.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT concerning 
labor. 
 HOUSE BILL 0796.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT concerning 
labor. 
 HOUSE BILL 0797.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to labor relations. 
 HOUSE BILL 0798.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to labor relations. 
 HOUSE BILL 0799.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT concerning 
employment. 
 HOUSE BILL 0800.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT concerning 
employment. 
 HOUSE BILL 0801.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT concerning 
employment. 
 HOUSE BILL 0802.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT concerning 
employment. 
 HOUSE BILL 0803.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0804.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to health in the workplace. 
 HOUSE BILL 0805.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to health in the workplace. 
 HOUSE BILL 0806.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to health in the workplace. 
 HOUSE BILL 0807.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to health in the workplace. 
 HOUSE BILL 0808.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to health in the workplace. 
 HOUSE BILL 0809.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to health in the workplace. 
 HOUSE BILL 0810.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to unemployment insurance. 
 HOUSE BILL 0811.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to unemployment insurance. 
 HOUSE BILL 0812.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to unemployment insurance. 
 HOUSE BILL 0813.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to unemployment insurance. 
 HOUSE BILL 0814.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to unemployment insurance. 
 HOUSE BILL 0815.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to unemployment insurance. 
 HOUSE BILL 0816.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to employment. 
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 HOUSE BILL 0817.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT concerning 
employment. 
 HOUSE BILL 0818.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to employment. 
 HOUSE BILL 0819.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to employment. 
 HOUSE BILL 0820.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT concerning 
employment. 
 HOUSE BILL 0821.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT concerning 
employment. 
 HOUSE BILL 0822.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to employment. 
 HOUSE BILL 0823.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to employment. 
 HOUSE BILL 0824.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to employment. 
 HOUSE BILL 0825.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McKeon, AN ACT in relation 
to employment. 
 HOUSE BILL 0826.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Osterman, AN ACT in 
relation to municipal government. 
 HOUSE BILL 0827.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Osterman, AN ACT in 
relation to municipal government. 
 HOUSE BILL 0828.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Osterman, AN ACT in 
relation to municipal government. 
 HOUSE BILL 0829.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Osterman, AN ACT in 
relation to municipal government. 
 HOUSE BILL 0830.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Osterman, AN ACT in 
relation to municipal government. 
 HOUSE BILL 0831.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Osterman, AN ACT in 
relation to municipal government. 
 HOUSE BILL 0832.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Osterman, AN ACT in 
relation to municipal government. 
 HOUSE BILL 0833.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Osterman, AN ACT in 
relation to municipal government. 
 HOUSE BILL 0834.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Osterman, AN ACT in 
relation to municipal government. 
 HOUSE BILL 0835.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Osterman, AN ACT in 
relation to municipal government. 
 HOUSE BILL 0836.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Osterman, AN ACT in 
relation to the Metropolitan Water Reclamation District. 
 HOUSE BILL 0837.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Osterman, AN ACT in 
relation to the Metropolitan Water Reclamation District. 
 HOUSE BILL 0838.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Osterman, AN ACT in 
relation to the Metropolitan Water Reclamation District. 
 HOUSE BILL 0839.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Osterman, AN ACT in 
relation to county government. 
 HOUSE BILL 0840.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Osterman, AN ACT in 
relation to county government. 
 HOUSE BILL 0841.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Osterman, AN ACT in 
relation to county government. 
 HOUSE BILL 0842.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Osterman, AN ACT in 
relation to county government. 
 HOUSE BILL 0843.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Osterman, AN ACT in 
relation to townships. 
 HOUSE BILL 0844.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Osterman, AN ACT 
concerning townships. 
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 HOUSE BILL 0845.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Osterman, AN ACT in 
relation to townships. 
 HOUSE BILL 0846.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Osterman, AN ACT 
concerning local government. 
 HOUSE BILL 0847.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Osterman, AN ACT in 
relation to local governments. 
 HOUSE BILL 0848.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Molaro, AN ACT concerning 
taxes. 
 HOUSE BILL 0849.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Molaro, AN ACT concerning 
taxes. 
 HOUSE BILL 0850.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Molaro, AN ACT in relation 
to taxes. 
 HOUSE BILL 0851.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Molaro, AN ACT in relation 
to taxes. 
 HOUSE BILL 0852.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Molaro, AN ACT concerning 
taxes. 
 HOUSE BILL 0853.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Molaro, AN ACT concerning 
taxes. 
 HOUSE BILL 0854.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Molaro, AN ACT in relation 
to taxes. 
 HOUSE BILL 0855.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Molaro, AN ACT in relation 
to taxes. 
 HOUSE BILL 0856.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Molaro, AN ACT in relation 
to taxes. 
 HOUSE BILL 0857.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Molaro, AN ACT concerning 
taxes. 
 HOUSE BILL 0858.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Molaro, AN ACT in relation 
to property taxes. 
 HOUSE BILL 0859.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Molaro, AN ACT in relation 
to taxes. 
 HOUSE BILL 0860.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Molaro, AN ACT in relation 
to taxes. 
 HOUSE BILL 0861.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Molaro, AN ACT in relation 
to property taxes. 
 HOUSE BILL 0862.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Molaro, AN ACT in relation 
to taxes. 
 HOUSE BILL 0863.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Molaro, AN ACT in relation 
to taxes. 
 HOUSE BILL 0864.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Molaro, AN ACT in relation 
to taxation. 
 HOUSE BILL 0865.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Molaro, AN ACT in relation 
to taxes. 
 HOUSE BILL 0866.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Molaro, AN ACT in relation 
to income taxes. 
 HOUSE BILL 0867.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Molaro, AN ACT in relation 
to taxes. 
 HOUSE BILL 0868.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Molaro, AN ACT with respect 
to taxation. 
 HOUSE BILL 0869.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Molaro, AN ACT with respect 
to taxation. 
 HOUSE BILL 0870.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Davis, Steve, AN ACT 
concerning public utilities. 
 HOUSE BILL 0871.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Davis, Steve, AN ACT 
concerning public utilities. 
 HOUSE BILL 0872.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Davis, Steve, AN ACT 
concerning public utilities. 



 15 [January 31, 2003] 
 
 HOUSE BILL 0873.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Davis, Steve, AN ACT 
concerning public utilities. 
 HOUSE BILL 0874.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Davis, Steve, AN ACT 
concerning public utilities. 
 HOUSE BILL 0875.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Davis, Steve, AN ACT 
relating to telecommunications. 
 HOUSE BILL 0876.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Davis, Steve, AN ACT 
concerning utilities. 
 HOUSE BILL 0877.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Davis, Steve, AN ACT in 
relation to utilities. 
 HOUSE BILL 0878.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT in relation to 
veterans. 
 HOUSE BILL 0879.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT in relation to 
veterans. 
 HOUSE BILL 0880.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT concerning the 
military. 
 HOUSE BILL 0881.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT concerning the 
military. 
 HOUSE BILL 0882.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT concerning the 
military. 
 HOUSE BILL 0883.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT concerning the 
military. 
 HOUSE BILL 0884.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT concerning the 
military. 
 HOUSE BILL 0885.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT concerning the 
military. 
 HOUSE BILL 0886.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT concerning the 
military. 
 HOUSE BILL 0887.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT concerning the 
military. 
 HOUSE BILL 0888.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Brosnahan, AN ACT 
concerning consumer protection. 
 HOUSE BILL 0889.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Brosnahan, AN ACT in 
relation to business transactions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0890.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Brosnahan, AN ACT in 
relation to business transactions. 
 HOUSE BILL 0891.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Brosnahan, AN ACT 
concerning consumer protection. 
 HOUSE BILL 0892.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Howard, AN ACT in relation 
to technology. 
 HOUSE BILL 0893.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Howard, AN ACT in relation 
to technology. 
 HOUSE BILL 0894.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Scully, AN ACT concerning 
strategic planning. 
 HOUSE BILL 0895.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Scully, AN ACT concerning 
strategic planning. 
 HOUSE BILL 0896.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Scully, AN ACT concerning 
strategic planning. 
 HOUSE BILL 0897.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Scully, AN ACT in relation to 
economic development. 
 HOUSE BILL 0898.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Scully, AN ACT in relation to 
economic development. 
 HOUSE BILL 0899.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Scully, AN ACT in relation to 
economic development. 
 HOUSE BILL 0900.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Scully, AN ACT in relation to 
economic development. 
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 HOUSE BILL 0901.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Scully, AN ACT concerning 
powers of the Department of Commerce and Community Affairs. 
 HOUSE BILL 0902.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Scully, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agencies. 
 HOUSE BILL 0903.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Scully, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agencies. 
 HOUSE BILL 0904.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Scully, AN ACT concerning 
the Department of Commerce and Community Affairs. 
 HOUSE BILL 0905.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Scully, AN ACT concerning 
business. 
 HOUSE BILL 0906.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Scully, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agencies. 
 HOUSE BILL 0907.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Scully, AN ACT concerning 
business. 
 HOUSE BILL 0908.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Scully, AN ACT concerning 
powers of the Department of Commerce and Community Affairs. 
 HOUSE BILL 0909.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Holbrook, AN ACT 
concerning environmental safety. 
 HOUSE BILL 0910.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Holbrook, AN ACT 
concerning environmental protection. 
 HOUSE BILL 0911.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Holbrook, AN ACT 
concerning environmental safety. 
 HOUSE BILL 0912.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Holbrook, AN ACT 
concerning environmental protection. 
 HOUSE BILL 0913.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Holbrook, AN ACT 
concerning wetlands. 
 HOUSE BILL 0914.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Holbrook, AN ACT 
concerning environmental protection. 
 HOUSE BILL 0915.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Holbrook, AN ACT in relation 
to environmental safety. 
 HOUSE BILL 0916.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Holbrook, AN ACT in relation 
to environmental safety. 
 HOUSE BILL 0917.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Holbrook, AN ACT 
concerning environmental safety. 
 HOUSE BILL 0918.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McCarthy, AN ACT relating 
to public community colleges. 
 HOUSE BILL 0919.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McCarthy, AN ACT regarding 
public community colleges. 
 HOUSE BILL 0920.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McCarthy, AN ACT relating 
to higher education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0921.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McCarthy, AN ACT relating 
to higher education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0922.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McCarthy, AN ACT relating 
to higher education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0923.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McCarthy, AN ACT relating 
to higher education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0924.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McCarthy, AN ACT relating 
to higher education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0925.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McCarthy, AN ACT relating 
to higher education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0926.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McCarthy, AN ACT relating 
to higher education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0927.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McCarthy, AN ACT relating 
to higher education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0928.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McCarthy, AN ACT in 
relation to education. 
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 HOUSE BILL 0929.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McCarthy, AN ACT in 
relation to education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0930.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McCarthy, AN ACT with 
regard to higher education student assistance. 
 HOUSE BILL 0931.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McCarthy, AN ACT in 
relation to education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0932.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McCarthy, AN ACT in 
relation to education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0933.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McCarthy, AN ACT in 
relation to education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0934.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McCarthy, AN ACT 
concerning higher education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0935.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - McCarthy, AN ACT in 
relation to higher education. 
 HOUSE BILL 0936.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT concerning 
prompt payment. 
 HOUSE BILL 0937.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT concerning 
prompt payment. 
 HOUSE BILL 0938.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT concerning 
the State Treasurer. 
 HOUSE BILL 0939.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
courts. 
 HOUSE BILL 0940.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
State procurement. 
 HOUSE BILL 0941.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT concerning 
the Attorney General. 
 HOUSE BILL 0942.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
State procurement. 
 HOUSE BILL 0943.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
State employees. 
 HOUSE BILL 0944.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT regarding 
finance. 
 HOUSE BILL 0945.  Introduced by Representative Madigan, AN ACT in relation to the Attorney 
General. 
 HOUSE BILL 0946.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT concerning 
the Attorney General. 
 HOUSE BILL 0947.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
the Secretary of State. 
 HOUSE BILL 0948.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT to amend the 
State Finance Act. 
 HOUSE BILL 0949.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT concerning 
courts. 
 HOUSE BILL 0950.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT concerning 
juries. 
 HOUSE BILL 0951.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
the Secretary of State. 
 HOUSE BILL 0952.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in a relation 
to the Secretary of State. 
 HOUSE BILL 0953.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
State finances. 
 HOUSE BILL 0954.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
freedom of information. 
 HOUSE BILL 0955.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT concerning 
salaries. 
 HOUSE BILL 0956.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT concerning 
freedom of information. 
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 HOUSE BILL 0957.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in a relation 
to the Secretary of State. 
 HOUSE BILL 0958.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT concerning 
juries. 
 HOUSE BILL 0959.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT concerning 
courts. 
 HOUSE BILL 0960.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT concerning 
courts. 
 HOUSE BILL 0961.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
the General Assembly. 
 HOUSE BILL 0962.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
State finance. 
 HOUSE BILL 0963.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
the General Assembly. 
 HOUSE BILL 0964.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
the General Assembly. 
 HOUSE BILL 0965.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
the General Assembly. 
 HOUSE BILL 0966.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agency reorganization. 
 HOUSE BILL 0967.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agency reorganization. 
 HOUSE BILL 0968.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT concerning 
State mandates. 
 HOUSE BILL 0969.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
freedom of information. 
 HOUSE BILL 0970.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agency reorganization. 
 HOUSE BILL 0971.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT concerning 
libraries. 
 HOUSE BILL 0972.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT concerning 
finance. 
 HOUSE BILL 0973.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
the State Treasurer. 
 HOUSE BILL 0974.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
State employment. 
 HOUSE BILL 0975.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
State employment. 
 HOUSE BILL 0976.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT concerning 
State mandates. 
 HOUSE BILL 0977.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT concerning 
libraries. 
 HOUSE BILL 0978.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
the State Comptroller. 
 HOUSE BILL 0979.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
administrative procedure. 
 HOUSE BILL 0980.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT concerning 
the State Comptroller. 
 HOUSE BILL 0981.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT concerning 
the State Comptroller. 
 HOUSE BILL 0982.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT concerning 
the State Comptroller. 
 HOUSE BILL 0983.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT concerning 
agriculture. 
 HOUSE BILL 0984.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT concerning 
courts. 
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 HOUSE BILL 0985.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT concerning 
the departments of State government. 
 HOUSE BILL 0986.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agencies. 
 HOUSE BILL 0987.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
administrative rules. 
 HOUSE BILL 0988.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
public bodies. 
 HOUSE BILL 0989.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
public bodies. 
 HOUSE BILL 0990.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agency reorganization. 
 HOUSE BILL 0991.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
the General Assembly. 
 HOUSE BILL 0992.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agencies. 
 HOUSE BILL 0993.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
courts. 
 HOUSE BILL 0994.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT regarding 
the Attorney General. 
 HOUSE BILL 0995.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
the State Treasurer. 
 HOUSE BILL 0996.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
the General Assembly. 
 HOUSE BILL 0997.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Franks, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agency reorganization. 
 HOUSE BILL 0998.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agencies. 
 HOUSE BILL 0999.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agencies. 
 HOUSE BILL 1000.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agencies. 
 HOUSE BILL 1001.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agencies. 
 HOUSE BILL 1002.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agencies. 
 HOUSE BILL 1003.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agencies. 
 HOUSE BILL 1004.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT in relation to the 
regulation of professions. 
 HOUSE BILL 1005.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT concerning the 
regulation of professions. 
 HOUSE BILL 1006.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT concerning the 
regulation of professions. 
 HOUSE BILL 1007.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agencies. 
 HOUSE BILL 1008.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agencies. 
 HOUSE BILL 1009.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agencies. 
 HOUSE BILL 1010.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agencies. 
 HOUSE BILL 1011.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agencies. 
 HOUSE BILL 1012.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agencies. 
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 HOUSE BILL 1013.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT in relation to children 
and families. 
 HOUSE BILL 1014.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agencies. 
 HOUSE BILL 1015.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agencies. 
 HOUSE BILL 1016.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie, AN ACT in relation to 
executive agencies. 
 HOUSE BILL 1017.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to trusts. 
 HOUSE BILL 1018.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to civil procedure. 
 HOUSE BILL 1019.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT concerning 
probate law. 
 HOUSE BILL 1020.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT concerning 
family law. 
 HOUSE BILL 1021.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT concerning 
family law. 
 HOUSE BILL 1022.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to property. 
 HOUSE BILL 1023.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to real property. 
 HOUSE BILL 1024.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to estates. 
 HOUSE BILL 1025.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to the conveyance of land. 
 HOUSE BILL 1026.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to the conveyance of land. 
 HOUSE BILL 1027.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to real property. 
 HOUSE BILL 1028.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to property. 
 HOUSE BILL 1029.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to real property. 
 HOUSE BILL 1030.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to property. 
 HOUSE BILL 1031.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to State employees. 
 HOUSE BILL 1032.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to State employees. 
 HOUSE BILL 1033.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to the conveyance of land. 
 HOUSE BILL 1034.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to the conveyance of land. 
 HOUSE BILL 1035.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to trusts. 
 HOUSE BILL 1036.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to civil procedure. 
 HOUSE BILL 1037.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to civil procedure. 
 HOUSE BILL 1038.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to civil procedure. 
 HOUSE BILL 1039.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to courts. 
 HOUSE BILL 1040.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT relating to 
commercial transactions. 
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 HOUSE BILL 1041.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT concerning 
commercial transactions. 
 HOUSE BILL 1042.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to liens. 
 HOUSE BILL 1043.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to property. 
 HOUSE BILL 1044.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to real property. 
 HOUSE BILL 1045.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT concerning 
real property. 
 HOUSE BILL 1046.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to civil procedure. 
 HOUSE BILL 1047.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to civil procedure. 
 HOUSE BILL 1048.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to civil procedure. 
 HOUSE BILL 1049.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to civil procedure. 
 HOUSE BILL 1050.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to property. 
 HOUSE BILL 1051.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to property. 
 HOUSE BILL 1052.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT regarding 
business corporations. 
 HOUSE BILL 1053.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT concerning 
business corporations. 
 HOUSE BILL 1054.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to liens. 
 HOUSE BILL 1055.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to attorneys. 
 HOUSE BILL 1056.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to attorneys. 
 HOUSE BILL 1057.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to the conveyance of land. 
 HOUSE BILL 1058.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to civil liabilities. 
 HOUSE BILL 1059.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to civil liabilities. 
 HOUSE BILL 1060.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to civil liabilities. 
 HOUSE BILL 1061.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to civil liabilities. 
 HOUSE BILL 1062.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Fritchey, AN ACT in relation 
to privacy. 
 HOUSE BILL 1063.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Lang, AN ACT in relation to 
gambling. 
 HOUSE BILL 1064.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Lang, AN ACT in relation to 
gambling. 
 HOUSE BILL 1065.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Lang, AN ACT in relation to 
gaming. 
 HOUSE BILL 1066.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Lang, AN ACT in relation to 
horse racing. 
 HOUSE BILL 1067.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Lang, AN ACT in relation to 
gaming. 
 HOUSE BILL 1068.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Lang, AN ACT in relation to 
gaming. 
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 HOUSE BILL 1069.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Lang, AN ACT in relation to 
gaming. 
 HOUSE BILL 1070.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Lang, AN ACT in relation to 
gaming. 
 HOUSE BILL 1071.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Lang, AN ACT in relation to 
gaming. 
 HOUSE BILL 1072.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Lang, AN ACT in relation to 
gaming. 
 HOUSE BILL 1073.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Mautino, AN ACT in relation 
to insurance. 
 HOUSE BILL 1074.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Mautino, AN ACT in relation 
to insurance. 
 HOUSE BILL 1075.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Mautino, AN ACT concerning 
insurance. 
 HOUSE BILL 1076.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Mautino, AN ACT in relation 
to insurance. 
 HOUSE BILL 1077.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Mautino, AN ACT concerning 
insurance. 
 HOUSE BILL 1078.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Lyons, Joseph, AN ACT in 
relation to financial regulation. 
 HOUSE BILL 1079.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Lyons, Joseph, AN ACT in 
relation to financial regulation. 
 HOUSE BILL 1080.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Lyons, Joseph, AN ACT in 
relation to financial regulation. 
 HOUSE BILL 1081.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Lyons, Joseph, AN ACT in 
relation to financial regulation. 
 HOUSE BILL 1082.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Flowers, AN ACT in relation 
to health care. 
 HOUSE BILL 1083.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Flowers, AN ACT in relation 
to health care. 
 HOUSE BILL 1084.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Flowers, AN ACT in relation 
to insurance. 
 HOUSE BILL 1085.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Flowers, AN ACT concerning 
insurance. 
 HOUSE BILL 1086.  Introduced by Representatives Madigan - Currie - Flowers, AN ACT concerning 
health facilities. 
 
 
 At the hour of 3:00 o'clock p.m., Representative Poe moved that the House do now adjourn. 
 The motion prevailed. 
 And in accordance therewith and pursuant to SENATE JOINT RESOLUTION  1, the House stood 
adjourned until Tuesday, February 4, 2003, at 1:00 o’clock p.m. 
 
 


